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This article investigates market-type reforms of the service welfare states
in Sweden and Denmark. Sweden has implemented such reforms to a
greater extent than Denmark. The explanation should be found in the dif-
ferent responses of the Social Democratic parties to the NPM agenda in
general and market-type reforms in particular. In Denmark, the Social
Democrats have opposed market-type reforms, whereas in Sweden they
have been more open towards these ideas. With this focus, the paper differs
from most other writings about variation in the extent of NPM.

INTRODUCTION

Within the last twenty years, the rich Organization for Economic Co-
operation and Development (OECD) countries have been adjusting their
models of welfare capitalism to a changed economic environment (cf.
Scharpf and Schmidt). One type of adjustment has been reforms of the
public sector, such as the introduction of explicit measures of perfor-
mance, decentralization, private-sector styles of management, contracting
out, and privatization. These reforms are generally known as the “New
Public Management” (NPM) (Clark; Hood 1991; Rhodes).

The scholarly debate about NPM has increasingly been influenced 
by what Rune Premfors (1998, 145–146) labels the “structured pluralism
story,” focusing on variation in the extent to which different countries
have implemented NPM reforms (e.g., Clark; Farnham et al.; Flynn and
Strehl; Hood 1996; Kickert; Peters; Pollitt and Bouckaert; Pollitt and
Summa). This is also the focus of this article. Its theoretical claim is 
that party politics, especially the responses of the Social Democrats to the
NPM agenda, should receive more attention than is usually the case in
the literature on NPM.

The empirical part of this paper provides an examination of the extent
of market-type reforms of four welfare services in Denmark and Sweden:
health care, care for the elderly, child care, and primary schools. The
extent of market-type reforms is argued to have been greater in Sweden
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than in Denmark. Subsequently, the relationship of the differences in 
the responses of the Social Democratic parties in the two countries is
shown. In Denmark, the Social Democrats (Sveriges socialdemokratiska
arbetareparti—SAP) have opposed market-type reforms, whereas in
Sweden, they have been more open towards these ideas.

The paper starts with a short overview of the NPM literature and the
arguments put forward about variation in the extent of NPM reforms. It
then develops a theoretical argument as to why party responses, espe-
cially the responses of the Social Democrats, should matter for the extent
of NPM reforms. This is followed by a short discussion of the research
design of the article. The next section offers a discussion of the extent of
market-type reform in the four areas in the two countries. The paper con-
tinues with an outline of the NPM reform debate in the two countries,
with special focus on the responses of the Social Democratic parties
towards market-type reforms. The concluding section of the paper dis-
cusses the implication of the theoretical argument and the prospects for
generalizing it.

THE NPM DEBATE AND WHY SOCIAL DEMOCRATIC 
RESPONSES SHOULD MATTER

As mentioned above, the scholarly debate about NPM has increasingly
focused on the question of variation in the extent to which different coun-
tries have implemented NPM reforms. Four types of factors are normally
discussed as explanations for variation (cf. Hood 1996; Olsen and Peters;
Peters; Pollitt and Summa; Wright). The first group of arguments concerns
macroeconomic factors. The macroeconomic troubles that hit the OECD
countries in the 1970s are one of the reasons why NPM reforms have
reached the political agenda in these countries. However, the extent of
these troubles has varied across OECD countries. One hypothesis about
NPM reforms would be that the countries that have faced the biggest
macroeconomic troubles have implemented NPM reforms to the largest
extent. The second group of arguments concerns party politics. NPM
reforms are often seen as part of the neoliberal agenda of the 1980s. A
second hypothesis about variation in NPM reforms would be that they
have been implemented to a larger extent in countries and at times with
right-wing governments. The third group relates variations to different
administrative cultures stemming from different “state traditions.” Guy
Peters (1997) contends that the Anglo-American tradition is more recep-
tive to market-type reforms than is the case in the Germanic tradition in
particular (cf. also Clark; Loughlin and Peters; Rhodes). The fourth group
of arguments relates variation to different political institutions. These 
may be found at two levels. First, macroinstitutional differences, such as
majoritarian versus consensus systems, may result in different magni-
tudes of NPM reforms (cf. Barlow et al.; Pollitt and Summa; Yesilkagit 
and de Vries). Second, differences may be due to microinstitutional 
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differences. For instance, Peter Christiansen points to the power of public
sector unions as part of the explanation for the limited extent of market-
type reforms in Denmark. As made by Jørgen Christensen and Thomas
Pallesen, the argument about microinstitutional structures can also be
used to explain differences in the extent to which various types of NPM
ideas are implemented.

In addition to the focus on the responses of the Social Democratic
parties, this article argues that NPM reforms should be seen within a
broader context of welfare-state reforms, whereas in most NPM reform
literature, they are analyzed as public administration reforms. However,
when it comes to reforms such as the introduction of quasimarkets in the
health-care sector or private providers of care for the elderly, NPM
reforms become part of the political battle over the welfare state.

The need to analyze NPM reforms within a welfare-state context is 
particularly urgent when dealing with the Scandinavian countries. The
literature on different welfare-state regimes (Esping-Andersen 1990, 1999;
Huber and Stephens 2000) has documented considerable differences
among countries in the provision of social services such as care for the
elderly and child care. In Scandinavia, there is an extensive range of pub-
licly funded and provided social services. The public sectors there include
the extensive service welfare states. Therefore, public sector reforms must
here be analyzed within a broader welfare-state context.

In the wake of Pierson’s (1994, 1996) seminal work, welfare-state re-
trenchment—or reforms—has attracted a lot of scholarly interest. This
debate has been detached from the debate about NPM reforms, and with
a few exceptions (e.g., Clayton and Pontusson; Timonen) it has paid little
attention to welfare services. As argued by Ross (2000b), the debate has
also not paid much attention to party politics, yet a number of studies
have recently done so (Green-Pedersen 2001; Kitschelt; Ross 2000a). Fur-
thermore, these studies emphasize partisan effects to be more complex
than implied by the argument that welfare-state retrenchment is the 
result of right-wing incumbency. The theoretical aim of this paper is to
show that the recently developed arguments about partisan politics and
welfare-state retrenchment are also relevant for the understanding of 
variation in NPM reforms.1

The starting point for the argument about partisan effects is the litera-
ture on agenda-setting, especially framing of political issues (Riker; Shein-
gate). The issue of NPM reforms can be framed in rather different ways,
with important consequences for their political attractiveness. Opponents
of NPM reforms can be expected to portray such reforms as part of a
neoliberal attempt to dismantle the welfare state, and to argue that they
are just a disguise for cutbacks in the welfare state and will result in a
decreasing quality of public services. Proponents of NPM reforms will
argue that they lead to more efficient service provision, and thus the 
possibility of offering services of the same quality but at lower cost or
better services at the same cost. Proponents will also try to argue that
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NPM reforms form a way of fighting a bureaucratic “nanny state”—for
instance, by providing consumers with a greater choice of services. For
politicians, the attractiveness of NPM reforms depends very much on the
possibilities of framing such reforms in the latter way. If introducing NPM
reforms will be seen by the electorate as an attempt to provide citizens
with better and cheaper services as well as more choices, politicians may
find them attractive. If such reforms are seen as part of an ideological
attack on the cherished welfare state, they invoke the politics of blame
avoidance (Pierson 1994; Weaver). In addition, the formative moment of
the NPM debate is important because, as argued by the agenda-setting
literature (cf. Baumgartner and Jones), issue definitions tend to be stable
over long periods of time.

The question, then, is one of what determines the way the NPM issue
is framed. Right-wing parties can be expected to be proponents of 
NPM reforms. Whereas it is very difficult for right-wing parties to justify
welfare-state retrenchments except in times of severe economic crisis
(Green-Pedersen 2000), NPM reforms seem to offer such parties better
chances of a positive framing. The parties can argue that they aim at a
better welfare state, not a leaner one. However, right-wing parties are cru-
cially dependent on the strategy of the Social Democratic parties.

Using the idea of issue ownership or issue association (Budge and
Farlie; Ross 2000a), one may argue that the welfare-state issue is owned
by Social Democratic parties in the sense that the electorate sees Social
Democratic parties as the true proponents of the welfare state. Right-wing
parties are seen as more preoccupied with keeping down taxation and
managing the economy. If Social Democratic parties oppose NPM reforms
as an ideological attack on the welfare state, right-wing parties will find
it very hard to portray NPM reforms along positive lines. On the other
hand, if Social Democratic parties embrace NPM reforms as a way of
renewing and improving the welfare state, a consensus around a positive
NPM story may emerge, making the implementation of such reforms
much more attractive. The next question concerns which factors deter-
mine the response of the Social Democratic parties. One important factor
is whether they are in government or opposition. In government, Social
Democratic parties are held responsible for the problems of the public
sector and the promise of cheaper and better service included in the 
NPM agenda may be attractive. In opposition, the NPM agenda can be
opposed without necessarily having to come up with very well specified
alternatives.

Summing up, the theoretical argument is that the response of Social
Democratic owners of the welfare state is crucial because it determines
whether NPM reforms are framed in a way that makes them politically
attractive to implement. Furthermore, the position of the Social Demo-
cratic parties at the formative moments is important, since issue defini-
tions tend to be “locked in.”2 If Social Democratic parties have once
embraced NPM reforms positively, they will find it hard to change to a
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negative response. Finally, whether the Social Democrats are in govern-
ment or opposition at the formative moment can be expected to influence
their response strongly.

RESEARCH DESIGN

Having outlined the theoretical argument of the paper, I can now defend
the choice of Denmark and Sweden as the two cases for investigation.
Both countries are prime examples of the Scandinavian service welfare
states (Huber and Stephens 2000), and the public sector in the two coun-
tries is thus basically the same (cf. Lane). The implication of this is that
the microinstitutions in the two countries are largely similar. For example,
both countries have very strong public sector unions. The macropolitical
institutions are also largely similar, just as both countries belong to the
Scandinavian administrative culture (Loughlin and Peters). Finally, in
both countries, the welfare state has faced dire economic straits within the
last twenty years, although the development over time has been some-
what different. In Denmark, the economy was “at the brink of the abyss”
in the early 1980s, then recovered somewhat in the 1980s and early 1990s
before doing very well in the last part of the 1990s (Nannestad and Green-
Pedersen). The Swedish economy did somewhat better than the Danish
in the 1970s and 1980s; it then witnessed a meltdown in the beginning of
the 1990s, from which it has recovered quite quickly (Hemerijck and
Schludi). Altogether, most theoretical arguments about NPM reforms
would not predict any difference in the extent of NPM reforms between
Denmark and Sweden.

However, arguments about party politics would predict such dif-
ference. Arguments linking NPM reforms with right-wing incumbency
would predict Denmark to have gone farther in terms of NPM reforms.
The reason is that Denmark had nonsocialist governments from 1982 to
1993, whereas the nonsocialist government in Sweden from 1991 to 1994
has been the only such government since 1982. The theoretical argument
about the response of the Social Democrats would predict just the oppo-
site. In both countries, the welfare-state issue is clearly owned by the
Social Democratic parties, yet as will be argued below, the Social Demo-
cratic parties in the two countries have found themselves in different
political situations and have responded differently to the question of
NPM reforms.

Before turning to the empirical part of the paper, two further questions
must be discussed. The first one is the definition of market-type reforms.
Following Pollitt and Summa, it is useful to distinguish between differ-
ent dimensions of the NPM agenda. One such dimension is marketiza-
tion, or what the OECD (11) describes as “market-type reforms.” The gist
of this dimension is the introduction of the characteristics of a market—
most importantly competition, but also pricing—into the public sector.
Examples of such reforms include contracting out, free choice of provider,

THE ROLE OF DIFFERENT SOCIAL DEMOCRATIC RESPONSES 275



internal markets, user fees, and privatizations (cf. Hansen; Pollitt, and
Summa, 8; OECD). Thus, the reforms studied in the following sections do
not include, for instance, decentralization or user influence in the form of
user boards. The reason for focusing on market-type reforms of welfare
services is that this is often the most controversial part of the NPM agenda
and is thus an area where the effects of party politics should be visible.
Finally, I focus on the introduction of market-type reforms in four core
welfare services: health care, care for the elderly, child care, and primary
schools.

The second question relates to the role of local governments in the pro-
vision of welfare services in Scandinavia. Counties and municipalities
organize the services, often quite independently of central government
(Albæk, Rose, Strömberg, and Ståhlberg). In other words, if market-type
reforms have been introduced in Denmark and Sweden, local govern-
ments will often have introduced them. Nevertheless, the argument of
this paper is that the political struggles at the national level have been
crucial.

There are two ways in which the national level influences the local
level. First, the local level organizes the services within a national leg-
islative framework, and this framework may, for example, preclude con-
tracting out. Second, the political debate and framing of the NPM issue
largely takes place at the national level. Each county and municipality in
Scandinavia is part of the countrywide debate, not an independent polit-
ical system. These two avenues of influence constitute necessary condi-
tions for the enactment of market-type reforms in local governments. This
is obvious in relation to national legislation, but is also the case in rela-
tion to the national debate. By way of example, even though national 
legislation may permit contracting out, local politicians are only expected
to be willing to contract out if the debate taking place at the national level
has framed the issue along positive lines.

MARKET-TYPE REFORMS OF WELFARE SERVICES IN DENMARK 
AND SWEDEN

In the following, the extent of market reforms in the four service areas
will be discussed area by area. The extent of market-type reforms will be
evaluated by looking at political decisions made by either the national
government or local governments—that is, political outputs. An evalua-
tion of the extent of market reforms could also have included outcomes.
In relation to, for instance, free choice for the users, whether or not such
choices actually imply competition is dependent upon the users’ actual
utilization of the free choices. Nevertheless, outcomes in this sense are 
not included because the above argument is not meant to explain, for
instance, user behavior, even though it may be extended to do so. 
Furthermore, focus in the following is on reforms—that is, changes in a
market-oriented direction. However, questions about the market charac-
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teristics present in the services before the NPM debate cannot be ignored,
since, in some areas, the two countries had different starting points likely
to affect the possible reforms.

The Health-Care Sector

Both Denmark and Sweden are examples of the public, integrated model
of health care, in which services are financed through general taxation
and publicly provided. Furthermore, in both countries health care is
decentralized, as the responsibility for provision is placed with the coun-
ties. Nonetheless, some differences exist. Denmark has a family doctor
system under which patients are allowed to choose their own doctor and
doctors are self-employed. However, competition is very limited since the
government regulates the number of general practitioners. Sweden has
no family doctor system, and general practitioners are public employees.
Furthermore, patients had no free choice of primary health care. In
Sweden, limited user fees for primary care and for hospital visits have
existed for a long time, whereas in Denmark these services are free of
charge (Saltman and Figueras).3

In Sweden, the health-care sector reform process began in the 1980s
with other types of NPM reforms, such as the delegation of financial
responsibility to individual hospitals and the introduction of global
budgets (Anell; Anell and Svarvar; Diderichsen). Market-oriented re-
forms, introduced in the 1990s, can be divided into three types: splitting
providers and purchasers; free choice for the patients; and reforms of
primary health care, including more room for private alternatives (cf.
Blomqvist and Rothstein, 192–198).

The general idea behind splitting providers and purchasers is that
boards with political representation buy health-care services from pro-
viders who, even though they are still public, compete with each other.
Today, the majority of Swedish counties have split the provider and 
purchaser role (SOU, 146). The number of boards in each county buying
health-care services varies from one to around fifteen (Anell; Anell and
Svarvar; Rehnberg).

Before 1991, Swedish patients had no right to choose either hospital or
primary care. This has changed. All Swedish counties now allow a free
choice of primary care, and most of them also offer free choice of hospital,
including hospitals in other counties (Anell). The possibilities of choosing
health care without referral varies across counties, but in a number 
of counties the possibilities have become quite extensive (Svensson and
Nordling). In 1994, patients were also given the right to choose a family
doctor, private or public, but this system was abolished again when the
Social Democrats regained power (Blomqvist; Rehnberg).

Private practitioners have also gained a stronger foothold in primary
health care. There have always been a few private practitioners in major
cities, and at the beginning of 1994 the nonsocialist government intro-
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duced the free right of private practitioners to establish themselves. As
patients were guaranteed public reimbursement, competition was thus
introduced in primary health care. Upon return to government, the Social
Democrats also reversed this reform, but allowed the already-established
private practitioners to continue their service (Blomqvist; Rehnberg).

In Denmark, other types of NPM reforms, such as the delegations of
financial authority and global budgets, have also been introduced 
(Christensen and Pallesen; Pallesen). However, most market-type reforms
have been very limited (Jespersen). Provider/purchaser models have not
become common, the organization of the primary health-care sector has
remained largely unchanged, and user fees, in areas where they exist in
Sweden, have hardly been discussed. Furthermore, visiting a hospital or
specialist without a referral from a general practitioner is still largely
impossible in Denmark (cf. Pallesen and Pedersen; Vrangbæk 1999). The
only significant market-type reform of Danish health care is the right in
principle of the patient to choose a hospital in a different county, intro-
duced by national legislation in 1992. However, since the counties decide
for themselves how hospitals are paid for patients from a different county,
and since a hospital can reject a patient from another county, the right 
of the patient is limited in practice, though it is not without content
(Vrangbæk 2000). In summary, as argued by Thomas Pallesen and Lars
Pedersen, if the Danish health-care system is unique, that uniqueness has
to do with the lack of reforms.

Comparing market-oriented health-care reforms in the two countries,
as argued by Sahlin-Andersson (301), Sweden has gone further than
Denmark. This difference is most obvious in the hospital sector. User 
fees in Swedish health care also increased during the 1990s, when the
counties were given more freedom to decide the level of fees (SOU, 146).
Sweden has introduced market-type reforms in primary care, but some
of the conditions introduced in Sweden have long existed in Denmark.
Obviously, the Swedish reforms do not represent a revolution of the
health-care system (cf. Anell). Yet, as argued by, for instance, Claus 
Rehnberg and Paula Blomqvist, the reforms in Sweden have been sub-
stantial, which is not the case in Denmark.

Care for the Elderly

The Swedish and the Danish welfare states offer extensive care for 
the elderly in the form of home help, residential homes, and sheltered
housing. Traditionally, a decentralized, public, integrated model has also
dominated care for the elderly in both countries. Local governments have
provided the care, financing this out of general taxation.4 In the 1990s,
Sweden took some steps away from the model, which did not happen in
Denmark.

In 1992, a reform of Swedish care for the elderly, “Ädelreformen,”
transferred care for the elderly from the counties to the municipalities.
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Since then, the municipalities have implemented market-type reforms of
two kinds (Szebehely). First, today the majority of Swedish municipali-
ties have implemented the same kinds of provider and purchaser reforms
as the counties have done in health care (Socialstyrelsen 1999b; SOU,
174–175). Second, an increasing number of Swedish counties have started
buying care from private firms. In 1999, 9 percent of the Swedish elderly
were cared for by a private firm, compared to 3.5 percent in 1993 (Social-
styrelsen 1999b, 7). Municipalities either contract out the whole operation
of residential homes, home help, or sheltered housing or buy places in
institutions set up by private providers.5 In 1999, around 25 percent of the
Swedish municipalities had contracted out part of the operation of home
help, residential homes, or sheltered housing to private firms, including
all municipalities with more than 100,000 inhabitants (KommunAktuellt
Direkt; Socialstyrelsen 1999b, 26–28). Around 40 percent of the munici-
palities bought places in institutions set up by private providers (Social-
styrelsen 1999b, 34–35). These figures do not indicate that private firms
have taken over Swedish care for the elderly, but they do suggest that
such firms have gained an increasing foothold. Today, several major
private firms operate within Swedish care for the elderly, with a financial
turnover of several hundred million Swedish kroner (KommunAktuellt
Direkt; Socialstyrelsen 1999b).

In Denmark, the organization of care for the elderly is more or less
unchanged. There are examples of contracting out of home help and 
residential homes, as well as models in which the elderly have been
offered the choice between public and private providers, but these 
examples number relatively few (Bertelsen 2000; Det Kommunale Kartel
Organisationsafdelingen; Institut for Serviceudvikling; Kommunernes
Landsforening). Purchaser provider models are also largely unknown
within Danish care for the elderly (Institut for Serviceudvikling). All
together, market-type reforms of the Danish care for the elderly sector
amount to a couple of cases of contracting out that received a lot of public
attention, but the market has not gained a real foothold there. Finally,
home help is still mainly free of charge, whereas user fees in the Swedish
system of care for the elderly have been increasing (Socialstyrelsen 1999a;
Szebehely).

Summing up, market-oriented reforms of care for the elderly are more
extensive in Sweden than in Denmark. This does not mean that a revo-
lution has happened in Swedish care for the elderly, but market-type
reforms have been implemented in many Swedish municipalities, which
is not the case in Denmark.

Child Care

As with other welfare services, the responsibility of child care has been
decentralized to the municipalities, which finance child care out of general
taxation. However, in both countries significant user fees exist, varying
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from municipality to municipality. Care is traditionally provided in public
institutions or by registered child-minders in their private homes.6

In Denmark, market-type reforms of child care were discussed from
1982 on. After a long and intense debate, an amendment to the Social
Service Act was passed in 1990, paving the way for the municipalities to
give financial support to private persons or organizations providing child
care outside the organizational framework of the municipalities and 
thus introducing competition (Damgaard 1997; Damgaard 1998, chapter
6). However, only a limited number of these “pool schemes” have been
established, caring for only around 2 percent of the children in 1999, and
the figure is not increasing (Danmarks Statistik 1997, 5, 15; Danmarks 
Statistik 2000a, 12, 19).7 Furthermore, the new Social Service Act passed 
in 1997 has allowed contracting out of child-care institutions (Borchorst),
but very few examples of this can be found (BUPL; Kommunernes 
Landsforening). In sum, market-type reforms of Danish child-care ser-
vices have been very limited.

In Sweden, the possibility of nonpublic provision of child care was
introduced in the 1980s. Until 1992, only nonprofit providers were al-
lowed, but in 1992, the municipalities were allowed to support child care
provided by profit-maximizing firms (Montin 1992; Montin and Elander).
In the 1980s, the Swedish municipalities did not make much use of the
new possibilities (Montin 1992), but in the 1990s, alternative provision
increased significantly. Thus, in 1999 13 percent of Swedish children
younger than six being cared for received care from a private provider
(Skolverket 2000a, 12–16). In around half of the cases, parents’ associa-
tions organize private provision.8 Private profit-maximizing firms consti-
tute around 25 percent of the cases (Skolverket 2000b, 23).

Comparing the experience of the two countries in child care, market-
type reforms have been more widespread in this field in Sweden. For
instance, where less than ten examples of child care run by private firms
can be found in Denmark (BUPL), in 1999 Sweden had 278 child-care
institutions run by private profit-maximizing firms (Skolverket 2000b, 
23). As in other service areas, user fees in Swedish child care have been
increasing, which is not the case in Denmark (Lehto, Moss, and Rost-
gaard). Again, what has happened in Sweden is not a revolution, but, as
in care for the elderly, market-type reforms have gained an increasing
foothold.

Primary Schools

Primary schools constitute the area of services in which the historical dif-
ferences between Denmark and Sweden are the greatest (Lindbom 1998).
Both countries have public and tax-financed school systems, but the his-
torical role of private or independent schools is different. Unlike the case
in Sweden, such schools have a long tradition in Denmark. Private schools
in Denmark are financially dependent on public support, as the user fees
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only cover around 15 percent of the operating costs (Christiansen) and
the schools have to abide by government regulation concerning tests and
so on (Christensen 2000, 200). However, they do constitute an element of
competition.9 Almost no market-type reforms of Danish primary schools
have taken place. For instance, Danish parents’ opportunities to choose a
different public school from the one allocated to them by the municipal-
ity still remain very limited in practice (Christensen 2000).

As in other areas, the reforms of Swedish primary schools started in
the 1980s with other NPM reforms such as decentralization. The munici-
palities gained much more influence on primary schools, as they have
always had in Denmark (Lidström and Hudson; Lindbom 1995, 64–74).
In principle, Swedish parents were also given the right to choose which
public school their children should attend (Lidström, 139). In the 1990s,
the Swedish primary school system witnessed other market-type reforms.
In 1992, the nonsocialist government introduced a voucher system giving
parents the right to choose between public and private schools. If the
parents chose a private school, the voucher had the value of 85 percent
of the average costs for a pupil in a public school. In 1993, private schools
were also given the opportunity to charge reasonable user fees. However,
after the Swedish Social Democrats returned to government power, they
abolished this possibility. They also decreased the value of the voucher to
75 percent of the public costs, but from 1996 on, the law stipulated that
the voucher should correspond to the costs per pupil in public schools
(Blomqvist and Rothstein, 162–165; Lidström and Hudson, 19–25). Some
Swedish municipalities have responded to the national regulation by both
promoting independent schools and stimulating parents to actively
choose between schools. However, the number of municipalities practic-
ing this approach decreased towards the end of the 1990s compared to
the beginning of the decade (Lidström).

Comparing the two countries in the primary-school area is more diffi-
cult than in other areas because of their different starting points. Market-
type reforms have been introduced in the Swedish primary school system,
mainly by introducing competition through the support for private
schools. In Denmark, hardly any market-type reforms have been intro-
duced, but competition from private schools has long existed.10

The Four Areas Seen as One

When looking at the four areas discussed above as a whole, it is appar-
ent that market-type reforms have been more extensive in Sweden than
in Denmark. This conclusion about the direction of change holds true for
all four areas discussed. However, in two cases, private schools and the
right to choose primary care, the changes in Sweden have brought the
country to the point where Denmark has been for a long time.

The report of the government commission investigating the current
state of the Swedish welfare state (Kommitté Välfärdsbokslut) describes
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the 1990s as the “decade of the market” in relation to welfare services
(SOU, 178–184). As explained above, stating that a revolution has taken
place in Sweden would be to overstate the case, but, as argued by Torsten
Svensson (144–163), market-type reforms have gained an increasing
foothold in the Swedish welfare state. This is not the case in Denmark,
where the analysis confirms Peter Christiansen’s conclusion that the idea
of market solutions to problems of public sector governance was a “pre-
scription rejected.”

DIFFERENT RESPONSES OF THE SOCIAL DEMOCRATIC PARTIES

As explained above, the theoretical argument of this paper claims that dif-
ferences in the extent to which countries have implemented NPM reforms
have been influenced by the differing responses of the Social Democratic
parties. Thus, in the following, the first aim is to show that the responses
of the Social Democratic parties in Denmark and Sweden have differed
and how this has caused a different debate in the two countries. The
second aim is to discuss the reasons for the different responses.

In Denmark, the “formative moment” in the debate about the question
of welfare-state reforms including NPM reforms was the coming to power
of a nonsocialist government in 1982. The Danish economy was at 
the “brink of the abyss,” and the new government launched a compre-
hensive “crisis solution” containing a privatization program implying
market-type reforms (Greve; Kristensen 1987, 1988). Like most other ele-
ments in the crisis solution, the privatization program met stiff resistance
from the Social Democrats and the trade unions. The general opposition
strategy of the Social Democrats was to attack the new government 
by portraying its policies as an ideological attack on the welfare state 
(cf. Green-Pedersen 2000, chapter 9). This was also the response to the 
privatization program. As the Social Democratic spokesman put it in a
debate in the Danish parliament: “We do not perceive privatization as an
endeavor to achieve greater efficiency, but as an endeavor to cut back by
creating inequality. It runs contrary to our perception of human nature,
and so we will reveal and fight such endeavors to put the clock back”
(quoted in Kristensen 1988, 13). As argued by Ole Kristensen (1988,
13–14), the Social Democrats were successful in establishing the premises
of the debate along the lines of characterizing privatization as a basic
attack on the welfare state, and the privatization program was dead
before it started (cf. also Greve, 37–38). After this failure, the government
launched a much more modest “modernization program,” but this 
also largely failed (Christensen 1991). As exemplified by the attempts of
market-type reforms of child care, strong political resistance from the
Social Democrats and the trade unions made the implementation of such
ideas politically very difficult (Damgaard 1997). In most cases, the non-
socialist governments put market-type proposals back in the drawer, as
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the Prime Minister literally did with a privatization proposal from his
own party in 1983 (Dyremose).

In 1993, a Social Democratic–led government took over, and such gov-
ernments ruled Denmark until the end of 2001. In other areas of the
welfare state (cf. Green-Pedersen 2000), a “Nixon goes to China” dynamic
(Ross 2000a) has been visible, in the sense that the Social Democratic–led
governments have implemented proposals that were politically impossi-
ble for the nonsocialist governments. Such tendencies have also been
visible in relation to reforms such as privatization of telecommunications
and corporatizations (Christensen and Pallesen forthcoming).

However, in relation to market-type reforms of welfare services, the sit-
uation of the Danish Social Democrats has proved rather difficult. The
leadership of the party has tried to establish a more pragmatic line within
the party. By way of example, on two occasions it has tried to persuade
the rest of the party, including local politicians, to pursue a more prag-
matic line towards contracting out. In both cases, however, the leadership
has lost the battle (Bille). As mentioned earlier, national legislation has
also opened up for contracting out of child care, without the municipali-
ties actually making use of the opportunities. The problem for the lead-
ership of the Danish Social Democrats is that they are locked into their
own rhetoric from the 1980s. As they successfully defined market-type
reforms as an ideological crusade against the welfare state, it has proved
impossible to persuade the rest of the party—and the public—that such
reforms are now a tool to achieve cheaper and/or better service. Thus,
the official line of the party is still the one found in the working program
from 1996 (Socialdemokratiet i Danmark) stating that the provision of
welfare services should remain a public task.

In Sweden, the “formative moment” of the debate about NPM reforms
was also a shift of government in 1982. Here, however, the Social Demo-
crats came back into power. The SAP had long felt vulnerable to attacks
from the nonsocialist parties for having created a bureaucratic nanny state
and partly interpreted the six preceding years out of power as a sign that
this criticism had the support of the electorate in Sweden. The new Social
Democratic government, therefore, put publicsector reforms on top of its
agenda and launched a special “public administration policy,” including
a ministry to take care of the issue (Gustafsson; Pierre; Premfors 1991). In
other words, the SAP admitted the need for changes in the Swedish pub-
lic sector. However, the means suggested by the SAP in 1982 were not
market-type reforms but other NPM reforms, such as decentralization
and a more service-oriented welfare state. The SAP’s idea was that such
reforms would prevent more market-type reforms from reaching the
political agenda (Antman, 36). As exemplified by the ban on profit-
maximizing firms in child care, the SAP generally rejected market-
type reforms with arguments very similar to those of the Danish Social
Democrats (Rothstein, 501–505).
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However, during the 1980s, there was growing criticism from within
the SAP that the government was not doing enough to reform the
Swedish public sector (Antman, 38–42). The public administration policy
launched in 1982 did not take the wind out of this criticism of the pub-
lic sector. After the 1988 election, the debate intensified, and the Social
Democrats started to abandon their rejection of market-type reforms
(Hadenius and Nilsson). In relation to, for instance, primary schools, the
SAP now accepted the basic content of the nonsocialist parties’ sugges-
tions (Schüllerqvist). In the Budget Bill for 1990, the party gave up its 
principal reservations against market-type reforms of welfare services
(Premfors 1998). The SAP was certainly not united on this issue, but, at
least for a while, the promarket wing of the party, centered around the
powerful Minister of Finance Kjell-Oluf Feldt, came to represent the party
line on the issue (Premfors 1991).

In 1991, SAP suffered a historic defeat in the election, which paved 
the way for a nonsocialist government. At the same time, the Swedish
economy experienced a meltdown. This situation opened a window 
of opportunity for the nonsocialist parties. The Social Democrats had
already admitted that the Swedish welfare state needed to be reformed
in a market-oriented way, and the economic crisis added fuel to this fire.
Thus, the nonsocialist parties implemented more radical market-type
reforms. The SAP protested against many of these reforms, and when the
party regained power in 1994, it reversed, for example, parts of the
reforms concerning health care and primary schools. However, the Social
Democrats have continued to pursue public sector reforms (Premfors
1998; Svensson). Thus, as a number of authors argue (e.g., Antman, 44–45;
Blomqvist; Håkansson, 60; Montin 1997, 264), the market-type reforms
implemented by the nonsocialist government from 1991 to 1994 followed
a path that had been laid out by the Social Democrats. The latter had
admitted that the public sector was “part of the problem, not the solu-
tion,” as Antman (20) put it. Reverting to a position similar to that of the
Danish Social Democrats was no longer possible. Thus, despite continu-
ing internal disagreement within the SAP (cf. Blomqvist and Rothstein,
9–12), the party no longer opposes the existence of private providers of,
for instance, child care and care for the elderly in the same way as does
their Danish counterpart.11 However, the SAP has strongly contested a
further radicalization of the market-reform agenda in the case of an
attempt to privatize a hospital in the Stockholm region (Svensson).

Summing up, the Swedish debate about NPM reforms proceeded along
different lines than did the Danish debate. In Sweden, the debate became
one concerning reforming an ineffective welfare state, leaving little choice
for the citizens (cf. Boréus, 263–265; Rothstein). In office, the SAP had to
respond to this criticism, and, despite internal disagreement, market-type
reforms were gradually accepted and defined as a way of providing better
and cheaper services. Once this had happened, even opposing more
radical market-type reforms proved very difficult politically. As argued
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by Evelyne Huber and John Stephens (2001, 246–248), for once the SAP
actually lost a debate about the welfare state in Sweden. In Denmark, the
Social Democrats in opposition strongly opposed market-type reforms.
Once in government, the party-leadership tried to achieve a more prag-
matic line, but without success.

The question, then, is one of why the responses of the Social Demo-
cratic parties have differed. Was it simply an effect of the Danish party
being in opposition and the Swedish being in government when the NPM
agenda emerged? To some extent, this is the case. Because the SAP was
in government, the problems of the public sector in Sweden became its
problems. In Denmark, the problems of the public sector were not the
problems of the Social Democrats before they regained office in 1993.
Therefore, the SAP could not simply reject the NPM–agenda. Yet addi-
tional factors have probably played a role. The Swedish Social Democrats
have dominated government more than their Danish counterparts 
have done, and their ownership of the welfare-state issue is thus stronger.
Therefore, problems of the welfare state in Sweden are problems of the
Social Democrats to a larger extent than is the case in Denmark. Further-
more, because Denmark already had elements of choice as well as a 
more decentralized public sector (Lindbom 1995; cf. also Knudsen and
Rothstein), criticizing the Danish welfare state for being paternalistic and
leaving no choices for citizens was more difficult. For instance, key ele-
ments in the nonsocialist criticism of the Swedish public sector included
the lack of choice in relation to primary schools and primary care. In
Denmark, citizens have had such choices for a long time.

Before I turn to the conclusion, two theoretical points deserve some
further comments in the light of the two cases. The first point relates to
the role of local governments. Local governments have enacted many 
of the Swedish reforms. Nonetheless, as mentioned above, this paper’s
argument centers around the national level because the political debate
about market-type reforms is a national debate. However, this does not
imply that looking in more detail at the local level is unimportant. In
Sweden, not all local governments have pursued market-type reforms,
and a few have done so even in Denmark. In other words, there is varia-
tion at the local level for which this article does not account. A number 
of other studies have already investigated this question (Bertelsen 2001
and Christoffersen and Paldam on Denmark; Lidström and Montin on
Sweden), and none of these studies find market-type reforms to be some-
thing particular to counties and municipalities governed by nonsocialist
parties. Still, in both countries some of the more radical reforms, such as
the privatization of the hospital in the Stockholm area and the few exam-
ples of contracting out of care for the elderly in Denmark, have been
enacted by nonsocialist local governments. Altogether, studying the local
level is clearly relevant. The danger of focusing on this level is that factors
working at the national level are ignored and differences between coun-
tries are never recognized.
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Finally, the role of economic crisis in the two countries deserves a 
few words. Could the reforms implemented in Sweden be explained by
the country’s economic crisis? The crisis put strong financial pressure on
the local governments (Timonen), and their willingness to implement
market-type reforms could be interpreted simply as a response to the
financial pressure. However, Danish local governments existed under
similarly strong financial pressure in the 1980s (Blom-Hansen and Palle-
sen) without implementing market-type reforms. The meltdown of the
Swedish economy in the beginning of the 1990s clearly added fuel to the
criticism of the public sector. Still, comparison with Denmark, which had
its economic crisis in the beginning of the 1980s, shows that such crisis
only led to market-type reforms because they had already been defined
as a way of achieving better or cheaper services and not as an ideologi-
cal attack on the basic idea of a welfare state.

CONCLUSION

Put briefly, in order to understand why countries implement NPM re-
forms to a different extent, the responses of the Social Democratic parties
must be taken into account. The differing responses of the Danish and
Swedish Social Democrats explain why market-type reforms of welfare
services are more widespread in Sweden than in Denmark. In this con-
cluding section, a number of implications of this argument will be dis-
cussed, as will the prospects of generalizing the argument.

The first implication of the argument is that the literature on NPM
reforms should pay more attention to party politics. As explained above,
most other scholarly writings about NPM have focused on various 
political institutions, economic troubles, and administrative traditions.
However, the impact of party politics is more complicated than see-
ing NPM reforms as an initiative by right-wing parties. Looking at the
Swedish case in isolation may support such an argument, because from
1991 to 1994 the right-wing government implemented several important
market-type reforms. However, once the Swedish development is com-
pared to Danish, such an argument becomes much less convincing. 
The coming to power of the right-wing government in Denmark in 
1982 should have been expected to initiate reforms paralleling those of
the Swedish government from 1991 to 1994. One needs to look at the
responses of the Social Democratic parties in the two countries to under-
stand the differences. In this way, the argument of this paper parallels an
argument made in relation to retrenchment of transfers (Green-Pedersen
2001) that studying party competition is important for understanding
variation in welfare-state reforms.

Further, it should be noted that the implication of the argument 
of this paper is not that it is easy to implement welfare-state reforms. 
Paul Pierson (1994) has put forward a number of plausible arguments 
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as to why welfare-state retrenchment is the politics of blame avoid-
ance. Christensen and Pallesen (2001) and Christiansen have pointed 
to factors such as resistance from public employees and risk-adverse 
and control-maximizing politicians that make NPM reforms—especially
market-type reforms—politically dangerous. These arguments about 
the politics of reform are plausible. However, it is important that they 
do not prohibit a search for the political conditions under which re-
forms can take place, such as the one conducted in this article (cf. also
Sheingate).

Another implication of this article is that NPM reforms should not just
be studied as public administration reforms; they must be seen within the
broader context of welfare-state reforms. In both Denmark and Sweden,
such an approach is necessary in order to understand the different re-
sponses of the Social Democratic parties in the two countries. The impor-
tance of this implication varies depending on the type of NPM reforms
studied. Some NPM reforms, such as reforms of management principles
and pay systems, are reasonable to study as public administration reforms
because they do not normally attract the same kind of attention from
political parties as do welfare-state reforms.

The developments in the two countries are also interesting in light of
the increasing political-science interest in policy legacies and path depen-
dency (Giamo and Manow; Pierson 2000) that is implicit in the arguments
about the impact of administrative or state traditions. Such arguments
would have predicted that the prior existence of some market character-
istics in Denmark—such as, for instance, private schools—would have
made the country more receptive to market-type reforms. This has proved
false, and the reason has to do with the opportunities for framing the
political debate available to the political parties. Through this, the policy
legacy has been important, but in a different way from what is expected
by usual path-dependency logic.

The final question to be addressed concerns generalizing the argument
to other countries. In this regard, it is important to be aware that a focus
on market-type reforms of welfare services is less obvious outside 
Scandinavia, where such services are less extensive and often organized
in different ways. Yet the theoretical argument of this paper is not neces-
sarily restricted to market-type reforms of welfare services, and it should
be applicable to non-Scandinavian cases as well. The most promising
cases for generalization are probably the Antipodes. In Australia, and par-
ticularly in New Zealand, a wave of NPM reforms has already been set
in motion by 1980s labor governments. Thus, both countries—especially
New Zealand—have come to stand in the vanguard of NPM reforms.
Perhaps this development has something to do with the fact that labor
governments ruled when NPM ideas came on the political agenda and
responded positively to many of them (Castles, Gerritsen, and Vowles;
Denemark; Schwartz).
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NOTES

1. A few scholars discussing the Swedish experience have actually pointed to
the role of the Swedish Social Democrats (Pierre; Premfors 1998; see also
Schwartz).

2. Thanks to Carsten Daubjerg for suggesting that the concepts of historical
institutionalism could clarify my argument on this point.

3. In Denmark, however, extensive user fees exist for dental care and paying
for prescription drugs. These areas are not included in the following 
analysis.

4. In Denmark, independent institutions have long played a role in elderly
care. In principle, these institutions are private; in reality, they are integrated
into the public sector and do not constitute an element of competition 
(Bertelsen 2000, 77–80).

5. In terms of the number of people cared for, contracting out is the more
important of these two kinds of care—covering 80 percent of the elderly
cared for by private providers—and is the kind that is increasing (Social-
styrelsen 1999b, 40).

6. These private persons are employed and supervised by the municipalities.
Thus, there is no element of private competition involved. As with care for
the elderly, Denmark has a tradition of independent institutions in child
care. However, apart from different pedagogical principles in some of these
independent institutions, they hardly differ at all from public institutions
and do not constitute an element of competition (BUPL 2000).

7. These figures can be interpreted as measuring both output and outcome.
Whether pool schemes are established depends on whether the municipal-
ities will allow them as well as on initiatives from parents.

8. As above, this figure can be interpreted as measuring both output and
outcome.

9. Other differences between the two countries include the fact that the
Swedish school system has historically been much more centralized and
that user boards, which have been mandatory in Denmark since 1970, have
never existed in Sweden (Lindbom 1995).
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10. The number of children attending private schools in Denmark has been
increasing, from 8.9 percent in the mid-1980s (Christensen 2000, 210) to 12
percent in 1999 (Dannmarks Statistik 2000:10). In Sweden, the number had
increased to 3.4 percent by 1999 (Skolverket 2000b, 88). However, these
figures measure outcome.

11. The recent working program of the SAP (Socialdemokraterne i Sverige, 17)
states that “alternative forms of service delivery such as co-operatives
. . . should be further developed.” This formulation should probably be
interpreted as stating that the party would prefer co-operatives instead of
profit-maximizing firms as competitors to public delivery. The SAP is not
enthusiastic about competition from private firms, but does not seem to
directly oppose it.
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